
Soups and Salads 

French onion soup with melted Swiss cheese and 
house croutons  6 

Soup: today’s house made soup  5 

Spinach Salad with spiced walnuts, fuji apples, chevre, 
and honey Dijon dressing  12 | half 7 

Caesar Salad: romaine, house made croutons,          
parmesan crisps, and creamy dressing  12 | half 7 

Small Plates 

 

French Onion Dip: creamy house-made dip with potato 
chips, carrots, and celery  7 

 

Crab Cakes with creole remoulade  10 

 

Chicken-Bacon-Ranch Egg Rolls  7 

 

Brussels Sprouts: flash fried and tossed with honey 
mustard, bacon, and parmesan  9 
 

Buffalo Cauliflower: roasted cauliflower tossed in 
buffalo sauce with ranch  10 

 

Sweet chili boneless wings with Yum Yum sauce  12 

 

Garlic Cheese Bread: with melted mozzarella cheese 
and marinara  7    1/2 order 5 

 

Flatbreads 

Artichoke with red onions, mushrooms, Swiss cheese, 
and roasted red pepper aioli  12 

Pesto: sundried tomatoes, mozzarella, and chevre  12 

Grilled Chicken with mozzarella, roasted poblano    
peppers, and chipotle-peach sauce   14 

Meats: Canadian Bacon, pepperoni, Italian sausage, 
mozzarella, and marinara  13 

Sandwiches 

served with French fries, house chips or fruit 

Pork Tenderloin Sandwich: panko breaded pork loin on 
an a toasted bun with lettuce, tomato, onion and mayo 
and zesty mustard on the side  15 

Triple Decker Club on wheat toast with Swiss cheese, 
ham, turkey, bacon, lettuce, tomato, and mayo  14 

Portobello Sandwich: grilled portobello mushroom 
with sundried tomato spread, romaine, pickled red  
onion, chevre, and balsamic on a brioche bun 15 

Broadway Burger (or chicken breast) with cheese, 
lettuce, tomato, pickles, and onions  15 

Mushroom and Swiss Burger (or chicken breast) with 
lettuce, tomato, pickles, and onions  16 

Western Burger: (or chicken breast) with bacon,    
cheddar cheese, BBQ sauce, lettuce, tomato, pickles, 
and an onion ring  16 

Chicken Torta (or beef burger patty): with pepperjack 
cheese, jalapeno-cilantro aioli, lettuce, tomato, red 
onion, and avocado  16 

Loaded French Dip: shaved beef sirloin grilled with  
caramelized onions and sautéed mushrooms, with 
swiss cheese on a baguette and au jus on the side  16 

Entrees 

**available after 4pm daily** 

Baked Penne Pasta: with Italian sausage, house      
marinara, and melted mozzarella cheese  19 

Tortellini: cheese filled pasta with grilled chicken breast 
and broccoli in pesto cream sauce  20 

Chicken Kathleen: chicken breast with mornay sauce, 
sautéed mushrooms, rice pilaf, and broccoli  20 

Beef Tenderloin Filet: with mashed potatoes, grilled 
asparagus, fried onion, and red wine demi  38 

Mediterranean Salmon: with chilled orzo salad and          
mixed greens with kalamata-feta relish  25 

Shrimp Etouffee: with jambalaya risotto and a grilled 
andouille sausage link  21 

The kitchen closes at 9:30pm nightly. 

Please be advised the consumption of raw or undercooked eggs or meat may increase the risk of foodborne illness for certain individuals 

20% service charge may be applied to groups of 6 or more people 


